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[Inflorescentia] wrote:
“https://www.bitchute.com/video/392KJIhWKzZY/

This is a montage of videos calling for world kikedom to recite a prayer on
Sunday, 21st of February, at 6 PM pissrael time.

It's almost like they're trying to emulate the Spiritual War Room.

....

If we aren't going to launch a massive schedule to have that fucking
prayer shatter their rotten teeth as they're reciting it -- we could, at least,
quadruple our FRTR efforts on that Sunday, methinks.”

The enemy, all things considered, are here, and they are observing everything. It
has been the case they have been also mailing in intervals to let everyone know.

They will also come here, writing in hebrew, visiting the forum, etc. This is why
oftentimes you will see some jews asking literally to infiltrate us. Long story short,
they read things and their more capable ones or those who spearhead their
spiritual efforts, do see other things also.

They clearly steal and mimic the JoS as they did with other Gentiles from whom
they stole spiritual information. What they are trying now is to make a botched
situation where they recruit all their own to participate as an energy station for the
work of other Rabbis at this date.

It's been known for a while that the enemy is not spiritually where they were
decades ago. Because people have done actual work and they are pushed back.
The world owes this to US and nobody else. Because nobody else does even
half of what we do. Arguably, it was centuries until anything like this has
happened.

So, when you see jews losing their minds here or other things, don't question
why this is the case. For once Gentiles have someone to defend them spiritually
and this is all of us. That's not to rest on it, but it should make everyone proud of
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our efforts. We're doing very well.

Others have posted a lot of posts about how Rabbis have gone on red alert,
telling them to speed it up, and do their utmost right now, and other things such
as how "The Forces of Darkness [aka. us] are out of control". They also make
statements of a "Final Battle" and other similar statements.

Specific jews have been clear that they need all the force they can muster, right
here, right now. The enemy is just giving an emergency signal. This should tell
everyone here also that it's not the time to sit idle. The next upcoming schedule
will see to that.

Some people have reported here, also, unusual attacks and so forth. Well of
course. Everyone gets these in a form or another. Because the enemy is at red
alert. They are throwing everything they have. Without going into many details,
the things they are using now, are things that can easily come back to destroy
them if they are not in control of the situation.

They project a lot of negativity on the spiritual environment. Gentiles always paid
for this. Meanwhile as far as we are concerned, we merely reverse their
protection and wiping the whole thing out. Think of this as a stupid mage who has
summoned Andras, Andras is ready to destroy them, and we go there and we
remove their "protective circle".

That will be it for them...

This is not to be underestimated as these people have done a lot of evil and they
had nobody to contest them or stop it. No matter what happens, the Tetra and
FRTR are going to guarantee none of their garbage does work. So, no matter
what happens, or even if the heavens fall flat, this has to continue until they are
done.

These will reassure this happens. Those who are here for a long time understand
the differences "up there", and how this has affected everything. The enemy also
dropped the formalities and they are letting everyone know too.

Soon there will be an upcoming schedule. As the situation has it, the enemy is
rapidly losing this when it comes to the social aspects of what they want to
prepare. The world may in general be in their control but the supernal forces are
drifting to a disadvantage with them.

Their plan was: ultimate quarantines, removal of all rights and freedoms, crash it
all, and then manifest a random kike to rule it all. This has been a plan they had



in the works for a while.

Conspiracy theorists knew this for decades. To make this happen, except of
buying out politicians and so on, nothing can help them more than spiritual
power.

Broadly for jews, the "Mosiach" or "Messiah" is just a kike that is supposed to
take over all the Gentile Nations, and impose global slavery. They have had this
aim for many centuries.

Don't ask me if the above is a viable plan, the enemy is not only superstitious but
evil and can be stupid because they are power hungry. They don't seem to even
mind the details of said plan, nor how it could go wrong and they get destroyed
instead.

Numerous jews are complaining about the situation that has befell Israel over the
"Co-Vid". Orthodox jews are beating up the police every day, and the police beat
them. As always, they complain and kvetch that this is the end for them because
they didn't get their way in a straight line as they are used to having.

Fate comes with an irony in that they are experiencing everything they have been
creating for Gentiles to experience. For example, it was Nethanyahu, their
president, who first declared a plan to microchip them in order to protect them
from "Coronavirus".

This has been their eternal plan for the Gentiles. This time over, they escaped
this by an inch. But it came really close to them.

"The Goat has returned back to them" in this case. Remember that ritual? Who
knows what other tyrant Israel will have soon, which will probably destroy Israel
entirely from the inside?

Jews are now trying to raise energy to simply direct it on Purim and their
upcoming Pesach, in order to curse their enemies. This is generally followed by
other acts as well. But all of it relies on their power, which is being hit for good.

This is why they make a desperate call to every single jew in order to pump as
much psychic energy as possible in order for them to recharge their energy
reserves.

These are thoughts they should have elaborated on what happens if things they
plan for the goyim, backfire on them collectively instead. They don't like it when
this happens. They are used to Gentiles carrying their curses and them being



always fine.

Just look at the numerous social plagues they are creating in the West and
worldwide, and ponder what happens when Israel will be "enriched" with the fruits
of its own cursing labor done against Gentiles.

Civil wars, wars with other Nations, financial slavery, rampant talmudic fashion
feminism, declining birthrates, economic collapse, spiritual oblivion, draconian
governments that want to smash them and their rights entirely, and so forth.
These only to name a prominent few.

They let loose the plagues and their physical agents do work politically and in
other ways to manifest these plagues.

They name them "Progress" and give them the most fanciful coating. People get
to see the fruit of this sometimes only too late. The thing is, with these plagues
they generally also threaten the enemy.

When they open up these curses on the world and all the Gentiles, they are
generally trying to keep themselves safe from these, by having a very strict
nation that does not allow any of these influences to grow within Israel. They
preach, for example, death by lowered birthrates only to Western civilization, and
their agents will promote curbing of birthrates in other places, but not in Israel.

The enemy works by unleashing a lot of negative forces psychically on the
environment, and then using knowledge, and the fact that others don't have it, to
escape consequences.

This cannot be done forever and they are dependent on their rituals for this.
Since these are being disabled, eventually, what they have reaped is what they
are going to sow.

We're doing great and as time goes, we'll do better. Stay strong and focused SS
Warriors, we are hitting HARD!

-High Priest Hooded Cobra 666

© Joy of Satan Ministries
www.joyofsatan.org

http://www.joyofsatan.org

